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Process to download Auctiontiger Mobile App
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1.

DRT - AuctionTiger/DRT-llI-Delhi-Syndicate
Bank

Start date : 14/07/2015 14:05:00
End date : 08/09/2015 11:00:00

Sale of Property By DRT-IlI-Delhi, Syndicate
Bank, Delhi V/s M/s. Delite Electricals & Ors

Auction No : RC No. 54/15

AID : 15937
_View JDocumentIManual bid

Bank of Baroda/Bank of Baroda-Patan
Start date : 14/07/2015 13:20:00
End date : 17/08/2015 11:00:00

Sale of Property By Bank of Baroda Patan Main
Branch V/s M/s. Bahucher Sales Corporation

Auction No : -
AlID : 15934

Manual bid

State Bank of India/State Bank of India-Solapur

Start date : 14/07/2015 11:56:00
End date : 14/08/2015 15:00:00

Cala nf Dranartyy By State Banl ~nf lndias Salannir

Live Future Archive
(16) (0) 2)
I inaian sank/inailan sank-wvolimpaLore

3. Indian Bank/Indian Bank-Gobichettipalayam

Start date : 20/06/2015 14:27:00
End date : 23/07/2015 11:00:00

Sale of Property By Indian Bank, Trichy Road
Branch V/s M/s. SIMTEL

Auction No : -
AID : 14662

[DocumentiManual bid

Start date : 20/06/2015 11:05:00
End date : 29/07/2015 11:00:00

Sale of Property By Indian Bank,
Gobichettipalayam Branch V/s M/s.
Tekmaasource.lnc

Auction No : -
AID : 14650

[DocumentiManual bid

4. DRT - AuctionTiger/DRT-Ernakulam-South
Indian Bank Ltd

Start date : 19/06/2015 17:26:00

User can
search

property by
city/ Bank/

property wise




Sale Notice Download Process

Auction document
Indian Bank/Indian Bank-Coimbatore

Auction No : -
AlD : 14662

Show more

1 Document name : Indian Sale Notice 01.pdf
Document brief : Sale Notice
Size (in MB) : 0.086
Date and time : 20 Jun 2015 14;23:22
Status : Approved

2 Document name : Indian Sale Notice 02.pdf
Document brief : Sale Notice
Size (in MB) : 0.085
Date and time : 20 Jun 2015 14:23:01
Status : Approved
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Complete action using

Just once

2:21 PM
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Trichy Road Branch, Ramanathapuram Post,
Coimbatore 641 045

Piace: Combatare
Date: 17.06.2015
Motice of intended Sale

Notice of intended sale under Rule 6 lIJ &“s 15! of I\. Security Inte:
(Enforeamant) Rules 2002 under The Securitization and Reconstruction U Flﬂneld
Assats and Enmnmml of
Security Interest Act 2002.

I My

B-5, Rajalakshmi An
New  Sidmhapudur, Caimi

e

Saravwathi, Wio.Chitrarasy, 15 ‘

Ko

it Aoad, Fofiach

R Mills:

Mr.C.Moorthy.
upudhur  Caimbatone |

Daar Sirs,

Sub: Loan sccount of M/s.SIMTEL with eur Trichy Hoad Branch , Coimbatore
- Reg

My SIMTEL svaked crediz facisties from Inian Basd. Trichy Road Branch, the ropaymaet of
which sre sevured by mertgagefypathecation of schedule mentianed Branerties, hersinafter
refarred ta a5 The Propertes’. MALSIMTEL faded to pay the cutstanding to the Bank.
therefire, & Demand Notice dated 13 10 2012, under Secticn 133) of the Secursization ang
constructsan of Financial Azsets and Enforcement of Securty Interest Act 2003 (e st

arg thersan. M5 SIMTEL snd others failed to make
PR daspies nckice deeed

As, MiSSIMTEL and others fased to make payment, despie demand notice deted
the Authorized Cfficer 1ook passassion of the scheduled mantionad properties
uncer the Act on 05.01.2013, after complying with &l legat formalities

A5 per Sec 13 [4) of the Act, the Secund Creditor is entitied t0 efMect sale of the assets taken
possassion of and réaiize the proceeds fowards the cutstanding balance. In accordance with
the same, the suthorized officer intend teiling the schecule martioned securities in tha
following mode:

The sale proposed to be held b5 by way of € suction mode

s Tude 6 (21 ared B (6 ) of the Secunty intenest |Enforcement) Rules 2007 Framed wuhder

e, Secuntifation ng Aecenstnsctian Of FInancial Agsats ang Emfarcemant of Securay
00

Interest 2,
30 darys retice of intenced sale 1§ requined to ba givan and harce we are i§suing Ehis notica

NOTICE




User Registration Screen on Mobile App
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AuctionTiger & AuctionTiger

Email ID

Password India
Confirm password Gujarat
(1) Version 1.2
City

What is the exact time of yo..

int answer Eg. +91-79 — 40230854
Hint answert

“q.+91 — 999939999C
Full name Eg. 491 — 9999999999

Company/Individual name (GMT+05:30) Bombay, Calc..

Enter Business category
keywords I.e. Laptop, printer,
scanner

Address

India




User Login Screen on Mobile App

® Fall il D 2:21 PM
& AuctionTiger Q =

@ New bidder
@) Call us
@ Mail us
@ Version 1.2

AuctionTiger
Email ID
Password

e

Important Note:

Registered bidder can login to
place the bid or to view the auction
result.

New bidder can register himself by
clicking upon 'New bidder' button.
In case of problem, please contact

us at support@auctiontiger.net.
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& AuctionTiger
ktestbidder1@localmail.com

T oEm

Important Note:

N\

Registered bidder can login to
place the bid or to view the auction
result.

New bidder can register himself by
clicking upon 'New bidder' button.
In case of problem, please contact

18 529 P3| 5G| RS FO1 N R8N B0 (O

@ # $ % & -




User Participation Process into e-Auction

"_T‘:" & |I”! rl|!| 4:35 PM

How to submit a bid ?

Step 1 : Read Auction Notice &
Document

Step 2 : Accept Terms & Conditions
Step 3 : Click on Manual Bid Button
Step 4 : Submit/Revise bid

View more

{ AuctionTiger

"_T‘:" H|I”! rl|!| 5:36 PM

Q =

My Live Future Archive Cancelled
Auction ) (0) (85) (0)

1. Indian Bank/Test Department

Start date : 14 Jul 2015 17:30:00
End date : 16 Jul 2015 18:00:00

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission

Auction No : -
AID : 15973 | Auction status : Live

2. Indian Bank/Test Department

Start date : 14 Jul 2015 13:00:00
End date : 14 Jul 2015 14:00:00

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission

Auction No : -
AID : 15926 | Auction status : Archive

[ View JDocument] Result

"_T‘:" H+|I}” rl|!| 5:36 PM

Indian Bank/Test Department
Auction No : -

AID : 15973 | Base currency : INR
Show more

We, hereby declare that,

1. We have read, examined and
understood the Auction documents
pertaining to this auction notice and have
no reservations to the same.

2. We offer to execute the works in
conformity with the Auction Documents
3. Our bid shall be valid for a period as
mentioned in the Auction document and it
shall remain binding upon us.

4. We understand that you are not bound
to accept the lowest bid in case of reverse
auction and highest bid in case of forward
auction or any other bid that you may

receive.




Eauction Bidding Process On Mobile App
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@ G Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
L : Line item wise bid submission (item No.1)
You can bid manually by specifying o )
| your bid amount every time you get Description of the Property As per Sale Notice
AU yt-bided till auction end date and Quantity : 1 Package
Remaining time : 48 Hr- 27 Min - 6 Sec B RO BiC
SNow more Time extension info. : Show J‘.DH%DSQJEI’B"? FALINDEED

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event AUSYRn I price - 10000900 -E- Yes
Line item wise bid submission (Item No.1) Increment : 1000.00

Your last bid price : No bid received

Description of the Property As per Sale Notice H1 price: No bid received

Quantity : 1 Package Your Rank: No bid received Please confirm your bidding amount @ il il D 5:38 PM
Remaining time :; 48 Hr- 28 Min - 28 Sec » ) ) 100000 (ONE HUNDRED
Time extension info. : Show Asking unit rate :| 100000 THOUSAND )

Auction start price : 100000.00 Asking total rate : “ Yes
Increment : 1000.00
Your last bid price : No bid received m

H1 price : No bid received

qwer tyu.

Your bid is accepted.

Your Rank : No bid received

Asking unit rate :

a /s d Bf g R 1y tk P

Asking total rate :

m &« zxcvbnmaea

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission (Item No.2) : .




Single Mobile Screen with Multiple Property Bidding

@ Hall D 12:21 PM

@ "all I 12:23 PM

& AuctionTiger & AuctionTiger @ O
Bid submission i haadli e
) Time extension info. : Show
o L G S Auction start price : 200000.00
Auction No : - Increment : 1000.00
AlID : 15973 | Base currency : INR Your last bid price : 200000.00
Show more H1 price : 200000.00
Demonstration Purpose Only - Non-P ent Your Rank: 1
Line item wise bid submlsswn Asking unit rate :| 200000.00
Description of the Property As per Sale Notice Asking total rate : 200000.00

Quantity

Remaining time :
Time extension info. :
Auction start price :
Increment :

Your last bid price :
H1 price:

Your Rank :

Asking unit rate :

Asking total rate :

- 1 Package

29 Hr - 43 Min - 35 Sec
Show

100000.00

1000.00

100000.00

100000.00

1

100000.00

100000.00

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission (Item No.2)

Quantity :

Remaining time
Time extension info.
Auction start price :
Increment :

Your last bid price :
H1 price :

Your Rank :

Asking unit rate :

Line item wise bid submissi

Demonstration Purpose Only—on PR ent
Qn (Iltem No.3)

Description of the Property As per Sale Notice

1 Package

- 29 Hr- 42 Min - 2 Sec
: Show

300000.00
1000.00
301000.00
301000.00
1

301000.00




User Outbidding Process

@O Hall il 3 12:33 PM

Auction No : -
AID : 15973 | Base currency : INR

Show mare

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission (Item No.1)

Description of the Property As per Sale Notice
Quantity : 1 Package
Remaining time : 29 Hr- 31 Min - 29 Sec
Time extension info. : Show
Auction start price : 100000.00
Increment : 1000.00
Your last bid price : 100000.00
H1 price : 105000.00
Your Rank : 2

Asking unitrae :| 100000.00 )

@ Ml il I3 12:34 PM

" AuctionTiger @ O

Bid submission

Indian Bank/Test Department
Auction No : -
AlID : 15973 | Base currency : INR

Show maore

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission (Item No.1)

Description of the Property As per Sale Notice
Quantity : 1 Package
Remaining time : 29 Hr- 30 Min - 40 Sec
Time extension info. : Show
Auction start price : 100000.00
Increment : 1000.00
Your last bid pri 09000.00
H1 price : 109000.00
Your Rank: 1

Asking unit rate :  109000.00

Asking total rate : 109000.00

Demonstration Purpose Only - Non PKI Event
Line item wise bid submission (Iltem No.2)




User Logout Process on Mobile App
{AuctionTiger .

Hello Indianbank Tes
Bidder A

() Refresh

(L) callus
(=) Mail us
(©)(@ogout
(D Version 1.2



Support Help Desk

* For any help, you may contact;

Tele: 079-40270538/554/568/587/594/598
Email —support@Auctiontiger.net




